
Scoring and Reviewing Images on Competition Website 

Contact the Competition Chair by phone or email with any questions. 

Coastal Camera Club Website URL: 
 

Competition Judge Site 
 

Or paste the following into a browser: 
 

https://competition.coastalcameraclub.com/ 
 

On the welcome screen select the button 
on the screen: 
 

 

Login to the Competition Website: 
 
On the login window enter the provided Username and 
Password. 
 
Note: Apple computers using the Safari browser may 
have issues logging in so please use another browser.  
 
Successful login will open the Rating Form 

 

 
 

Rating (Scoring) Form 
 
The rating form has detailed instructions by clicking the 
Using this Rating From button in upper right corner of 
the page. 
 
Image sorting by clicking the blue headers over Title, 
Comp Type (Category), and Score. 
 
Click the Title and then click the Comp Type to arrange 
the images by competition Type (category) and 
alphabetically by title. Sorting by category then title will 
match the provided PDF Scoring Sheet.  
 
Sorting by score and then Comp Type (Category) will 
allow for reviewing image ranking. 

 

 
 

Entering Image Scores 
 
Judges can scroll down the Rating Form and view the 
images, titles, and competition category.  
 
Score entry selection by using the pulldown pick list. 
Select a score to make an entry.  
 
To remove a score, click on Clear Item 

 
               No Score            -    Score Entered 
 

 
 

 

https://competition.coastalcameraclub.com/
https://competition.coastalcameraclub.com/


Saving Scores 
 
Click Save All at any time, a save reminder will pop up 
after every eight updated or edited scores. Click Save All 
to post scores. Judges may still update scores after a 
save. 

 

 

Competition Score Close 
 
The Competition Chairs will confirm scoring closed 
before judges click the finish button. If needed the 
Competition Chair can re-open the scoring. 
 

 

 

Viewing Images in Rating Form 
 
Click on an image to open the viewer. A test window will 
be open for adjusting the window size. Instructions on 
the opening screen are for adjusting the browser image 
opening. 
 
Note: Adjust image size and check the lower right corner 
of the window for the Percentage of Actual image size 
does not exceed 100% or the images may experience 
pixelation. 
 
 

 

 

Image Viewer Navigation 
 
At the bottom center of the viewer the Previous or Next 
buttons change the viewed image. The images order is 
based on the main screen sort order. 
 
A full-size button appears in lower left if the Image 
reduced by the browser to fit the screen. Based on the 
monitor, if a full-size image does not fit on the screen 
scroll bars will appear for viewing the full image. 
 

 
 

 
 

Note: The maximum competition image size is 2880 pixels high and 1920 pixels tall. Competition images 
may be smaller than the maximums with a minimum of 800 pixels on the long side.  

 


